&34 public works

N7, Department:
.{I Public Works
f REPUBLIC OF SOUTH AFRICA

PA-13.1: REGISTER OF BIDS ON CLOSING DATE

Register of Bids received on closing date: PA - 13.1 (GS)

Tender Number H19/008 Al
Description of Bid Repair and Refurbishment of Telkom Towers North and Annex Building: Appointment of a Construction
Project Management Services
Venue CGO Building, Cnr Bosman and Madiba Street, Pretoria
Closing date 30 August 2019
Closing Time 11:00
LIST OF BIDS RECEIVED
LEGAL/TRADING NAME OF BIDDER Prices:

NO.

01/43 | Nanza Amamiya Project Management & Construction Management R 729 258.58

02/43 | Element Consulting Engineers (Pty) Ltd R 1104 332.78

03/40 Imbeu Development & Project Management R 1331738.90

This register is to be published in the Departmental Website within 10 days after closing of Bid. The information should remain on the website
for at least thirty (30) days.

Any reference to words “Bid” or Bidder” herein and/or in any other documentation shall be construed to have the same meaning as the words “Tender” or “Tenderer”.
Page 1 of 6
For External Use Effective date April 2017 Version: 1.1



%}uﬁ public works

Department:

‘\‘ 7/:‘
/U Public Works
f REPUBLIC OF SOUTH AFRICA

Register of Bids received on closing date: PA - 13.1 (GS)

04/43 | ZAS Architects and Planners R 1426 863.10
05/43 | KKN Consulting Engineers and Projects R 1426 863.11
06/43 | Ukhukhula Holdings (Pty) Ltd R 1553 695.38
07/43 | Class A Trading 253 T/A Focus Project Management R 1585 403.45
08/43 | Limgroup Consulting Services R 1585 403.45
09/43 | Takgalang Consulting R 1585 403.45
10/43 LDM Consulting (Pty) Ltd R1743943.54
1143 | Calitrade T/A Altak Africa R 1886 630.11
12/43 Profteam cc R 1896 142.53
13/43 | Akweni Group (Pty) Ltd R 1902 484.13
14/43 | Pro-Serve Consulting (Pty) Ltd R 1902 484.13
15/43 | Rubiquant Consultants (Pty) Ltd R 1902 484.14
16/43 | KRMS Architects R 1965 900.28

This register is to be published in the Departmental Website within 10 days after closing of Bid. The information should remain on the website

for at least thirty (30) days.

Any reference to words “Bid” or Bidder” herein and/or in any other documentation shall be construed to have the same meaning as the words “Tender” or “Tenderer”.
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17/43 | lliso Consulting (Pty) Ltd T/A Nako lliso R 2045 170.45
18/43 | Aurecon South Africa (Pty) Itd R 2079 108.00
19/43 Virtual Consulting Engineers R 2 124 440.62
20/43 Indyebo Consulting Engineers and Projetcs R 2 187 856.76
91/43 Bisky Engineers and Associates (Pty) Ltd R 2219 564.82
99143 Lindile Mteza and Associates Quality Surveyors R 2219 564.83
93/43 South African Horizons (Pty) Ltd R 2219 564.83
24/43 Royal Haskoning DHV (Pty) Ltd R 2 282 980.97
25/43 T-Square Group R 2378 105.17
26/43 Diagonal Projects Africa R 2 378 105.74
97/43 SCIP Engineering Group (Pty) Ltd R 2 467 626.54
98/43 Baitseanape Consulting Engineers R 2523 202.76
29/43 20 Twenty Axsys Tower Jv R 2853 726.21

This register is to be published in the Departmental Website within 10 days after closing of Bid. The information should remain on the website
for at least thirty (30) days.

Any reference to words “Bid” or Bidder” herein and/or in any other documentation shall be construed to have the same meaning as the words “Tender” or “Tenderer”.
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30/43 Nala Construction Services (Pty) Ltd R 2853 726.21

31/43 ADI Investment (Pty) Ltd R 2853 726.21

32/43 SMEC South Africa R 2 853 726.21

33/43 Belgium Civils Projects (Pty) Ltd R 2 853 726.23

34/43 Yodh Enterprise (Pty) Ltd R 2999 903.44

35/43 Fedishia Civils R 3 037 708.38

36/43 Blackhead Construction (Pty) Ltd R 3170 806.90

37/43 Prosite Plan Africa (Pty) Ltd R 3487 887.59

38/43 RSG Engineering (Pty) Ltd R 3646 427.93

39/43 Umkhonto Professional Services R 28 930 556.04

40/43 Bono Infrastructure Facilities & Project Management No bid offer provided

41/43 Makone Consulting Engineers cc No bid offer provided

42/43 Qonda Consortium No bid offer provided
Vuikani Group No bid offer provided

This register is to be published in the Departmental Website within 10 days after closing of Bid. The information should remain on the website
for at least thirty (30) days.

Any reference to words “Bid” or Bidder” herein and/or in any other documentation shall be construed to have the same meaning as the words “Tender” or “Tenderer”.
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| 43/43 | |

LIST OF LATE BIDS RECEIVED

NO. LEGAL NAME OF BIDDER TRADING NAME

This register is to be published in the Departmental Website within 10 days after closing of Bid. The information should remain on the website
for at least thirty (30) days.

Any reference to words “Bid” or Bidder” herein and/or in any other documentation shall be construed to have the same meaning as the words “Tender” or “Tenderer”.
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Register of Bids received on closing date: PA - 13.1 (GS)
PROCUREMENT OFFICE:
Name of Procurement Officer Signature Date

This register is to be published in the Departmental Website within 10 days after closing of Bid. The information should remain on the website
for at least thirty (30) days.

Any reference to words “Bid” or Bidder” herein and/or in any other documentation shall be construed to have the same meaning as the words “Tender” or “Tenderer”.
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