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BBC accuses DA’s 
MacPherson of 
meddling inIDT’s 
operational matters 

  

Minister Dean MacPherson faces accusations that his concerns 
regarding certain projects target black firms./ Galio Images 

‘Minister cannot 
act like a bull in 
a china shop’ 

By Bongani Mdakane 
bongani@sundayworld.coza 

The Black Business Council 
(BBC) has accused the public 
works minister, Dean MacPher- 
son, of poking his nose in the 
operational matters of the 
Independent Develop- 
ment Trust (IDT). the public 
entity in charge of rolling out 
social infrastructure across 
South Africa. 
MacPherson is in the govern- 

‘ment as a minister through the 
DA ticket. 
BBC president Elias Monage 

told Sunday World on Friday 
that his organisation is demand 
ing an audience with the minis- 
ter to address issues related to 
his alleged interference. 
Tension has been brewing 

between MacPherson and the 
IDT bosses over issues relat- 
ing to tenders, administration 
and organisational affairs of the 
state-owned entity. 
Monage said MacPherson, 

in his public responses, had in- 
sisted that proactive oversight is 
needed to halt possible corrup- 
tion in IDT-handled projects, 
including a major multi-mil- 
lion-rand oxygen plant contract 
for public hospitals. 
However, the BBC and other 

critics claimed that constitution- 
al boundaries and governance 
norms have been repeatedly 
sidelined by the minister. 
Monage said MacPherson had 

been targeting black executives 
in the IDT. 
“MacPherson cannot act like 

abullin a china shop. His aim 
is to capture or reshape the IDT 
board, as he wants to install his 
loyal trustees, and potentially 
oust CEO Tehogo Malaka. 

“The minister maintains that 
the existing board is dysfunc- 
tional or compromised, necessi- 
tating decisive action to ensure 
accountability” he said. 
The BBC's stance comes 

    

   

   

      

   
    

  

  

after a series of events where 
MacPherson was accused of try 
ing toundermine the independ- 
ence of the IDT hoard and med- 
dling in the executive operations 
related to the expansion of few- 
erthan 20 sites at R216-million 
to an estimated 60 sites, with a 

final cost of R800-million. 
The expansion that was 

co-funded by the Global Fund, 
which issued no objection letter 
tothe IDT. 
Monage said that complaints 

that some companies in the ox- 
ygen plant tender lacked valid 
South African Health Products 
Regulatory Authority (Sahpra) 
credentials, and used ghost ad- 
dresses or submitted expired 
certificates was nonsense. 

    

     

   

  

Accusations 

based onthe 

“’ S 
black-owned 

He said that current indica 
tions suggest that MacPherson’s 
assertions regarding corrup- 
tion or grave irregularities lean 
heavily on partial documenta- 
tion such as allegedly dubious 
Sahpra licences and journalis- 
tic findings rather than a con- 
clusive forensic audit or a for- 
mal outcome from the Special 
Investigating Unit. 

“This does not automatical- 
ly disprove concerns raised by 
the minister but the absence of a 
published official inquiry leaves 
the ultimate legitimacy of these 
accusations uncertain. 

Responding to Sunday World, 
MacPherson said: * No one from 
the BBC has had the courtesy to 
raise any issues with me about 
IDT. I would encourage them 
to do s and not rely on false in- 
formation provided by compro- 
mised individuals. In short, I do 
not run the IDT, the CEO and 
Trustees do. T am not subjected 
toa cadre deployment commit- 
tee system so do not test “loyal- 
ty”.Iamonly interested in com- 
petence which has been lack- 
ing: 
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