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Keeping up with council 

EPWP employees to be upskilled 

2 hours ago 

Youth trained to maintain water meters 

Mayor of Ekurhuleni Mzwandile Masina recently announced a new Expanded Public 
Works Programme (EPWP) which will see 300 youth enter a three-year apprenticeship 
to enable them to maintain water meters. 

The programme is intended to create sustainable artisanal jobs and phase out 
dependency on external contractors who undertake the installation, repairs and 
maintenance of water meters at Ekurhuleni. 

Through a partnership with Technical and Vocational Education and Training Colleges 
(TVET), beneficiaries will exit the programme as qualified artisans, having obtained a 
trade test certificate and a vocational qualification, simultaneously. 

The programme has two components: a six-month theory and practical plumbing 
apprenticeship at an accredited TVET college, followed by 24 months of experiential 
training within the metro’s Department of Water and Sanitation. 

The metro has identified water governance as an immediate remedy to improve water 
use efficiency, and reduce non-revenue water in the municipality. 

Non-revenue water in the metro is currently standing at 34.7 per cent and the long-term 
target is to reduce this figure to 20 per cent (by 2023) in line with the metro’s water 
demand management strategy. 

Use My Ekurhuleni App properly 

The Ekurhuleni metro has observed that residents who are using the My Ekurhuleni App 
to log service queries are using incorrect information, prolonging the times to resolve 
their queries. 

This results in a non-response as dispatched officials cannot find the location for which 
the queries would have been logged. 

This means there is a waste of public resources and backlog on other queries. 

To avoid having unresolved service interruption issues, users are encouraged to ensure 
that the location functionality on their phones is always on and should click on the 
“current location”. 

Those logging a call from home while they are at work, for example, need to ensure they 
enter the correct home address. 

The My Ekurhuleni App encompasses all key local government services such as making 
burial site requests, reporting potholes, locating municipal and state facilities and the 
metro’s contact directory. 



Citizens with basic and feature phones can report service delivery issues via a USSD 
(*134*30263) option at no cost and those using smartphones can log queries through 
the mobile app at minimal data costs. 

The following reporting channels can be used: 

• Free SMS: 30263 

• Call Centre: 086 0543 000 

• USSD *134*30263 

 


